ERARNEN

LONDON BOROUGH

Assurance Group

London Borough of Barnet,
2 Bristol Avenue, Colindale,
London NW9 4EW

29 August 2019

Our ref: 5436428

Thank you for your request received on 2 July 2019, for the following information:

Please provide information in relation to the following:
Please complete your answers in the attachment:

Care Home Fee rates (£s)

1. What was the lowest rate (£ per week) you paid for placing a person in your
area for 2018/19 and 2019/20 based on the categories detailed below. Please
disregard Funding Nursing Care (FNC) from these calculations.

Fee Rates - Older People (65+) FY2018/19 FY2019/20 What percentage of
placements do these rates refer to?

Residential

Residential Dementia

Nursing (excl. FNC)

Nursing Dementia (excl. FNC)

Fee Rates - Working Aged Adults (18-64)

Residential

Nursing (excl. FNC)

2. What is the total number of placements made for permanent and respite
care for 2018/2019 & 2019 & 2020

Total number of Placements made for: FY2018/19 FY2019/20

Permanent Care

Respite Care

3. Please provide the average weekly fee paid (net of FNC) for the categories
detailed below for the full last financial year (18/19) and provide the number of
residents this average fee applies to

e.g. Residential Placements 50% (250 residents) placed at the Usual rate of £Y
per week

Fee Rates - Older People (65+) Average weekly Fee Rate (2018/19) No. of
Residents average fee rate applies

Residential

Residential Dementia

Nursing (excl. FNC)



Nursing Dementia (excl. FNC)
Other (Placements not within above categories)

We have processed this request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
Response

| can confirm that London Borough of Barnetholds the information you requested.
We have provided the information below that we are able to extract for ou database.

However, we consider that the following exemptions apply to some of the information
requested. The remaining information is not withheld and is below.

Please provide information in relation to the following:
Please complete your answers in the attachment:

Care Home Fee rates (£s)

1. What was the lowest rate (£ per week) you paid for placing a person in your
area for 2018/19 and 2019/20 based on the categories detailed below. Please
disregard Funding Nursing Care (FNC) from these calculations.

Fee Rates - Older People (65+) FY2018/19 FY2019/20 What percentage of
placements do these rates refer to?

Residential

Residential Dementia

Nursing (excl. FNC)

Nursing Dementia (excl. FNC)

Fee Rates - Working Aged Adults (18-64)

Residential

Nursing (excl. FNC)

2. What is the total number of placements made for permanent and respite
care for 2018/2019 & 2019 & 2020

Total number of Placements made for: FY2018/19 FY2019/20

Permanent Care

Respite Care

3. Please provide the average weekly fee paid (net of FNC) for the categories
detailed below for the full last financial year (18/19) and provide the number of
residents this average fee applies to

e.g. Residential Placements 50% (250 residents) placed at the Usual rate of £Y
per week

Fee Rates - Older People (65+) Average weekly Fee Rate (2018/19) No. of
Residents average fee rate applies

Residential

Residential Dementia

Nursing (excl. FNC)

Nursing Dementia (excl. FNC)

Other (Placements not within above categories)



The figures exclude FNC — FNC is not recorded on mosaic, it is paid by health
directly to nursing homes

We have managed to do the breakdown between dementia and mainstream,
however, where the data was not recorded have assumed that they are mainstream
placements (not dementia).

1819 1920

New placements Lowest rate Lowest rate
Residential 65+ 520 523
Residential 65+ dementia 571 565
Nursing 65+ 541 541
Nursing 65+ dementia 545 600
Residential 18-64 571 750
Nursing 18-64 589 412

Total placements 1819 1920
Permanent Care 1374 1129
Respite Care 121 45
Average weekly fee for 1819 and number of people this A KIV f % at or bel
average fee applied to (%) verage weekly fee average
Residential 65+ 699 70
Residential 65+ dementia 681 73
Nursing 65+ 711 66
Nursing 65+ dementia 766 65
Residential 18-64 1385 65
Nursing 18-64 1185 67

There is no Other category.
Further information

If you are interested in the data that the council holds you may wish to visit Open
Barnet, the council’s data portal. This brings together all our published datasets and
other information of interest on one searchable database for anyone, anywhere to
access. http://open.barnet.gov.uk/

Advice and Assistance : Direct Marketing

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council
officers (or other officers) provided in this response for direct marketing, you need to
be registered with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this
purpose. You must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for
direct marketing purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to
prevent Direct Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference.

You must also ensure you comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications
Regulations (PECR). For more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names
and contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct
marketing via any media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’
under PECR.

Your rights


http://open.barnet.gov.uk/
http://www.ico.org.uk/

If you are unhappy with the way your request for information has been handled, you
can request a review within the next 40 working days by writing to the Information
Management Team at: foi@barnet.gov.uk. Or by post to Information Management
Team (FOI) London Borough of Barnet, 2 Bristol Avenue, Colindale, NW9 4EW

If, having exhausted our review procedure, you remain dissatisfied with the handling
of your request or complaint, you will have a right to appeal to the Information
Commissioner at: The Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water
Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF (telephone: 0303 123 1113; website
www.ico.org.uk). There is no charge for making an appeal.


mailto:foi@barnet.gov.uk
http://www.ico.org.uk/

